PROJECT: NEW VEHICLE MAINTENANCE FACILITY
ROAD AND BRIDGE DEPARTMENT

RECEIVE BIDS:

OPEN BIDS:

JACKSON COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

April 10, 2013 no later than 2:00 p.m. CT

April 11, 2013 at 10:00 a.m.

Jackson County Board of County Commissioners
Board Room

NAME & ADDRESS BASE BID UNIT PRICE A: ( for asphalt street
resurfacing /sq yd)

ABBA Construction $1,177,807.00 $20.00

Jacksonville, F1 32259

Birkshire Johnstone $954,000.00 $12.50

Pensacola, F1 32505

Carters Contracting Services NO BID NO BID

Andalusia, AL 36421

Cathey Construction $962,947.00 $20.96

Mexico Beach, F1 32456

CGM Construction NO BID NO BID

Colquitt, GA39837

Clement Group NO BID NO BID

Coastline Engineering & Construction NO BID NO BID

Pkwy, PC Bch, F1 32407

Cook Brothers Inc $995,000.00 $22.00

Midway, F1 32343

Hughes Brothers $1,033,000.00 $19.00

Dothan, Al 36303

I-C Contractors $1,029,253.00 $13.78

Panama City, F1 32405

Kolmetz Construction $881,600.00 $25.00

Panama City, F1 32405
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Lewis & Associates NO BID NO BID

Dothan, Al 36302

M & W Construction $961,000.00 $21.50

Marianna, F1 3244

RAM Construction $936,000.00 $18.95

Midway, F1 32443

Riley Palmer Construction $1,061,169.00 $13.77

Tallahassee, F1 32317-2668

Shumaker, Inc NO BID NO BID

Panama City, Florida

Southland Rowe Roofing $1,078,345.00 $19.72

Midway, F1 32343

Sperry & Associates $1,018,714.00 $14.85

Tallahassee, F1 32303

OPENED BY:

OPENED BY:

DATE:

April 11, 2013

DATE:

April 11, 2013
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