

FY2020 BAND INSTRUMENTS

BID #9000-0503-118

I would like to recommend Washington Music Center for the following items for Cartersville High School:

4 Sousaphone w/Case at a total cost of \$28,563.00.

I would like to recommend Taylor Music for the following items for Cartersville Middle School:

2 4.3 Octave Concert Synthetic Marimba w/Field Frame at a total cost of \$7,232.00.

1 3 Octave Concert Vibraphone w/Field Frame (no motor) at a total cost of \$3,292.00.

1 3.5 Octave Soloist Synthetic Xylophone w/Field Frame at a total cost of \$2,171.00.

All items are low bid as specified.

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Alex Shu".

**BID # 9000-0503-118 BAND INSTRUMENTS  
TABULATIONS**

**Cartersville High School Band**

Instrument	Brand	Model	Qty	Washington Music		Taylor Music		Universal Melody		Music & Arts		Midwest Musical		Nick Rail Music	
				Unit Cost	TTL Cost	Unit Cost	TTL Cost	Unit Cost	TTL Cost	Unit Cost	TTL Cost	Unit Cost	TTL Cost	Unit Cost	TTL Cost
Sousaphone w/Case	Conn	20KSPW	4	7,140.75	28,563.00	7,177.00	28,708.00	7,259.64	29,038.56	7,143.00	28,572.00	7,205.00	28,820.00	7,595.00	30,380.00

**Cartersville Middle School Band**

Instrument	Brand	Model	Qty	Washington Music		Taylor Music		Universal Melody		Music & Arts		Midwest Musical		Nick Rail Music	
				Unit Cost	TTL Cost	Unit Cost	TTL Cost	Unit Cost	TTL Cost	Unit Cost	TTL Cost	Unit Cost	TTL Cost	Unit Cost	TTL Cost
4-Valve Euphonium, Silver	Yamaha	YEP-321(Silver)	4	1,905.55	7,622.20	1,911.00	7,644.00	1,759.45	7,037.80	1,905.00	7,620.00	1,960.00	7,840.00	1,830.00	7,320.00
4.3 Octave Concert Synthetic Marimba w/ Field Frame	Adams	ADM-MCKF43	2	3,688.20	7,376.40	3,616.00	7,232.00	3,723.36	7,446.72	3,722.00	7,444.00	NO BID	0.00	3,867.00	7,734.00
3 Octave Concel Vibraphone w/ Field Frame (No Motor)	Adams	ADM-VCSF30	1	3,351.10	3,351.10	3,292.00	3,292.00	3,383.04	3,383.04	3,383.00	3,383.00	NO BID	0.00	3,515.00	3,515.00
3.5 Octave Soloist Synthetic Xylophone w/Field Frame	Adams	ADM-XSKF35	1	2,215.70	2,215.70	2,171.00	2,171.00	2,236.80	2,236.80	2,236.00	2,236.00	NO BID	0.00	2,324.00	2,324.00
Concert Series Orchestra Bells, 2.6 Octave w/ Black Case	Adams	ADM-GCO26	1	1,683.15	1,683.15	1,650.00	1,650.00	1,699.20	1,699.20	1,699.00	1,699.00	NO BID	0.00	1,765.00	1,765.00